
Fen LGS

D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N Puanı

10 4 9,13 8 2 6,95 7 2 6,54 8 1 7,02 7 5 5,08 9 5 6,97 48 20 41,69 299,54

11 3 9,67 7 2 6,77 8 2 7,42 8 1 8,17 6 4 4,94 9 5 7,35 50 17 44,32 309,13

1 98 ZÜMRA ŞAHİN 7C 15 0 15,00 9 0 9,00 10 0 10 10 0 10 13 1 12,67 13 1 12,67 70 2 69,34 461,467

2 495 SALİHA KOÇ 15 0 15 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,67 10 0 10 12 1 11,67 13 2 12,33 69 4 67,67 450,099

3 490 ZEYNEP TAŞDEMİR 14 0 14,00 8 2 7,33 9 0 9,00 9 0 9,00 12 0 12 11 2 10,33 63 4 61,66 424,154

4 462 13 2 12,33 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,67 10 0 10,00 8 4 6,67 11 4 9,67 61 11 57,34 372,162

5 0 HATİCE KIZILKAYA 11 3 10,00 9 1 8,67 9 1 8,67 9 0 9,00 8 2 7,33 11 4 9,67 57 11 53,34 357,161

6 1642 13 2 12,33 9 1 8,67 8 1 7,67 8 1 7,67 6 6 4,00 12 3 11 56 14 51,34 347,765

7 0 RABİA BERRA DEMİR 12 3 11,00 8 1 7,67 10 0 10,00 8 1 7,67 7 3 6,00 9 3 8,00 54 11 50,34 337,406

8 443 GÜLSENA TARDAN 9 4 7,67 8 2 7,33 8 1 7,67 8 2 7,33 7 5 5,33 13 2 12,33 53 16 47,66 334,862

9 0 13 2 12,33 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 6 8 3,33 12 3 11 54 20 47,32 334,6

10 0 MERYEM ÇİTİL 11 4 9,67 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,67 7 2 6,33 6 6 4,00 11 4 9,67 52 19 45,67 316,792

11 4 EYLÜL GÜL KARTAL 9 6 7,00 6 4 4,67 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 8 6 6,00 11 4 9,67 49 25 40,67 307,447

12 0 ERVA KÖSE 6A 13 1 12,67 6 2 5,33 8 2 7,33 8 1 7,67 6 3 5,00 7 6 5,00 48 15 43,00 307,051

13 556 ESMA GÜNEŞ 10 4 8,67 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 9 0 9,00 5 2 4,33 9 6 7,00 51 14 46,33 304,641

14 186 ALEYNA ALTUN 11 4 9,67 8 1 7,67 8 1 7,67 9 0 9,00 6 5 4,33 8 5 6,33 50 16 44,67 301,607

15 0 SÜMEYYE PEKŞEN 7 11 3 10,00 7 2 6,33 8 2 7,33 8 0 8,00 6 4 4,67 8 6 6,00 48 17 42,33 297,65

16 0 9 6 7,00 6 3 5,00 9 1 8,67 8 0 8,00 4 5 2,33 9 5 7,33 45 20 38,33 268,371

17 0 ZEHRA SENDE 10 5 8,33 7 3 6,00 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,67 5 3 4,00 5 9 2,00 46 21 39,00 259,718

18 0 H KÜBRA TOKDEMİR 11 2 10,33 6 3 5,00 9 1 8,67 8 0 8,00 2 5 0,33 7 6 5,00 43 17 37,33 256,106

19 0 HATİCE KÜBRA OKTAY 8 5 6,33 6 3 5,00 6 3 5,00 9 0 9,00 5 6 3,00 6 5 4,33 40 22 32,66 243,065

20 218 ESRA HOŞ 8 3 7,00 7 0 7,00 5 2 4,33 7 2 6,33 4 6 2,00 5 4 3,67 36 17 30,33 230,057

21 0 EYLÜL SENA YÜCL 10 5 8,33 5 5 3,33 7 3 6,00 5 3 4,00 5 9 2,00 6 9 3,00 38 34 26,66 222,647

22 9 ELİF ZÜMRA AYDIN 6 8 3,33 6 3 5,00 4 4 2,67 10 0 10,00 6 6 4,00 5 7 2,67 37 28 27,67 218,143

23 28 ZÜLAL ESMA ŞENOL 7 8 4,33 4 6 2,00 6 4 4,67 9 1 8,67 1 7 -1,33 4 11 0,33 31 37 18,67 156,93
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