
Fen LGS

D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N Puanı

8 6 5,84 7 2 6,53 7 3 5,69 6 2 5,45 7 5 5,44 8 6 6,51 44 24 35,46 269,75

8 6 6,06 7 2 6,44 7 3 5,95 6 2 5,59 7 5 5,48 8 6 6,34 44 25 35,86 272,53

1 0 ZEHRA ÇAKIR 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 6 0 6,00 6 3 5,00 13 2 12,33 12 3 11 57 13 52,66 395,301

2 483 GÖKÇE AKARCA 5A 11 4 9,67 9 1 8,67 9 1 8,67 9 1 8,67 10 5 8,33 13 2 12,33 61 14 56,34 381,576

3 0 EFRANUR YILDIZ 5D 11 3 10,00 8 1 7,67 7 3 6,00 9 0 9,00 10 3 9,00 10 4 8,67 55 14 50,34 355,929

4 1801 SÜEDA NUR TUFAN 5P 12 3 11 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 8 6 6,00 11 4 9,67 59 15 54,00 355,208

5 0 AYŞE DEMİRDİL 5A 11 4 9,67 9 1 8,67 9 1 8,67 8 2 7,33 6 6 4,00 14 1 13,67 57 15 52,01 351,132

6 0 SUDENUR AYDIN 6D 13 2 12,33 7 3 6,00 6 4 4,67 5 3 4,00 11 3 10,00 9 6 7,00 51 21 44,00 346,97

7 0 AZRA SALİHA AYDIN 5D 10 2 9,33 9 1 8,67 8 2 7,33 5 2 4,33 8 3 7,00 12 3 11,00 52 13 47,66 344,107

8 507 13 2 12,33 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,67 10 0 10,00 8 6 6,00 9 6 7,00 56 18 50,00 338,354

9 0 RAJAA KHALİL 5B 7 8 4,33 9 1 8,67 6 4 4,67 10 0 10 12 3 11 10 5 8,33 54 21 47,00 336,435

10 0 8 7 5,67 9 1 8,67 7 3 6,00 10 0 10 11 1 10,67 9 6 7,00 54 18 48,01 335,476

11 0 HÜMEYRA GÜDEN 5 8 6 6,00 7 2 6,33 6 4 4,67 5 3 4,00 9 5 7,33 14 1 13,67 49 21 42,00 332,741

12 186 ZEYNEP ARDIÇ 5A 11 4 9,67 9 1 8,67 6 4 4,67 10 0 10 10 4 8,67 8 7 5,67 54 20 47,35 331,7

13 275 RABİA DAĞKUŞU 9 5 7,33 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 8 1 7,67 9 5 7,33 11 3 10 52 19 45,66 330,147

14 0 10 4 8,67 9 1 8,67 9 1 8,67 8 1 7,67 7 7 4,67 10 5 8,33 53 19 46,68 313,178

15 0 BEYZA DALGIN 9 6 7,00 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,67 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 8 6 6,00 51 18 45,00 306,828

16 0 İREM ŞEKER 5B 8 7 5,67 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 11 4 9,67 7 8 4,33 48 27 39,00 294,135

17 1113 GÜLŞAH BAYRAM 6 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 6 9 3,00 10 5 8,33 50 25 41,65 290,229

18 782 ECRİN YEN 5 8 6 6,00 9 1 8,67 9 1 8,67 4 2 3,33 5 7 2,67 12 2 11,33 47 19 40,67 289,133

19 0 10 5 8,33 7 3 6,00 10 0 10,00 7 2 6,33 2 2 1,33 11 4 9,67 47 16 41,66 285,782

20 1043 AYSİMA MUSLU 5G 10 5 8,33 10 0 10,00 7 3 6,00 5 5 3,33 6 8 3,33 10 5 8,33 48 26 39,32 285,4

21 0 İNCİ AVCU 8 7 5,67 7 3 6,00 6 4 4,67 9 0 9,00 9 3 8,00 7 7 4,67 46 24 38,01 284,725

22 0 HÜMA DURU SERGİN 5G 8 6 6,00 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,67 6 4 4,67 8 6 6,00 9 6 7,00 45 28 35,67 278,036

23 0 AZRA NUR ORAL 6 9 5 7,33 6 4 4,67 3 7 0,67 7 3 6,00 9 5 7,33 8 7 5,67 42 31 31,67 277,005

24 1872 CEYLİN ACAR 5G 8 7 5,67 9 1 8,67 9 1 8,67 8 2 7,33 7 6 5,00 7 7 4,67 48 24 40,01 269,818

25 521 HACER YÜCEL 5E 6 9 3,00 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 6 3 5,00 8 4 6,67 9 5 7,33 43 27 34,00 267,685

26 0 ZEYNEP ŞAHİN 5G 9 5 7,33 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 6 6 4,00 6 8 3,33 46 24 37,99 260,725

27 0 5 9 2,00 7 2 6,33 6 3 5,00 6 3 5,00 9 4 7,67 8 6 6,00 41 27 32,00 258,793

28 0 BETÜL KAYA 6 9 3,00 6 4 4,67 7 3 6,00 6 2 5,33 7 6 5,00 10 5 8,33 42 29 32,33 258,694

29 0 SÜMEYYET AŞEL 6 7 8 4,33 5 5 3,33 4 6 2,00 10 0 10,00 9 6 7,00 7 8 4,33 42 33 30,99 256,304

30 393 ELİF ZEHRA AKAR 5D 6 9 3,00 5 5 3,33 6 4 4,67 8 2 7,33 8 3 7,00 7 8 4,33 40 31 29,66 246,379

31 1229 AYŞE NAZ ONAT 6 8 7 5,67 5 5 3,33 8 2 7,33 1 9 -2,00 10 5 8,33 6 9 3,00 38 37 25,66 245,451

32 36 AYŞE BERRE ÇOBAN 5G 7 7 4,67 8 1 7,67 7 2 6,33 5 3 4,00 5 8 2,33 9 5 7,33 41 26 32,33 243,753

33 386 ELİF AKINCI 5C 6 7 3,67 6 4 4,67 6 4 4,67 7 6 5,00 9 6 7,00 34 27 25,01 236,053

AZRA HİLAL ERYILMAZ5A
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34 0 DAMLA BELLİ 7 6 5,00 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,67 6 2 5,33 7 6 5,00 5 9 2,00 41 27 32,00 234,998

35 0 ZEYNEP ŞAFAK 6 5 7 2,67 7 2 6,33 8 2 7,33 8 0 8,00 6 6 4,00 6 7 3,67 40 24 32,00 228,794

36 0 ZEYNEP SERT 6 7 2 6,33 5 2 4,33 2 2 1,33 4 0 4,00 3 4 1,67 8 4 6,67 29 14 24,33 225,513

37 0 NOUR KHUBIYA 8 7 5,67 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 5 7 2,67 5 10 1,67 42 30 32,00 222,869

38 0 AYSİMA BAYRAKTAR 7 5 5,33 5 2 4,33 8 2 7,33 1 0 1,00 9 6 7,00 30 15 24,99 218,101

39 0 ZEYNEP AKINCI 5C 7 7 4,67 6 3 5,00 7 2 6,33 3 5 1,33 6 7 3,67 5 7 2,67 34 31 23,67 208,26

40 0 NİSANUR POLAT 5E 7 8 4,33 9 1 8,67 7 3 6,00 10 0 10,00 6 9 3,00 3 12 -1,00 42 33 31,00 205,544

41 0 ASELNAZ GÜLDAL 5J 5 10 1,67 3 7 0,67 4 6 2,00 6 4 4,67 6 9 3,00 9 6 7,00 33 42 19,01 204,276

42 0 ZEYNEP SEVİM 5D 8 7 5,67 6 4 4,67 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,67 2 11 -1,67 6 6 4,00 36 34 24,67 189,84

43 0 ECRİN ARI 6 9 3,00 7 3 6,00 5 5 3,33 2 7 -0,33 7 5 5,33 4 11 0,33 31 40 17,66 186,256

44 16 İREM BERİL MERAL A 4 11 0,33 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 2 1 1,67 7 8 4,33 4 11 0,33 31 37 18,66 172,125

45 485 HİRANUR FİCAN 5B 3 1 2,67 2 4 0,67 3 3 2,00 2 7 -0,33 3 5 1,33 13 20 6,34 129,534

46 351 ZENNUR AYDIN 5D 3 11 -0,67 5 5 3,33 4 6 2,00 1 7 -1,33 4 8 1,33 5 10 1,67 22 47 6,33 127,212


